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June 1, 2020
MARTIN S & PEGGY A TERNES
1068 N WEST ROAD
PECK, KS 67120

Re: Unacceptable Application

Dear Mr. & Mrs. Ternes:

Returned herewith is your Application for Permit to Appropriate Water for Beneficial Use received by the Division of Water 
Resources on May 27, 2020, payed via credit card in the amount of $320 (Tracking No. PY00014376). The application is 
not acceptable for filing in its present form.

Your application does not indicate the proposed point of diversion in enough detail.  The proposed point of diversion must 
be described within at least a 10-acre tract (Quarter/Quarter/Quarter) of your indicated Section, Township, Range, and 
County. You may also specifically request a 60-day period of time in which to locate the site, which requires the proposed 
point of diversion to be listed within at least a 160 acre tract (Quarter) of your indicated Section, Township, Range, and 
County.

Your $320 payment will be held until your application is returned. If you don not wish to re-submit the application, and 
need a refund, please contact us at 785-564-6640 for more information.

Upon return of the acceptable application with required original signatures and information, it will be assigned a priority 
based upon the date and time it is received in the office of the Chief Engineer.  If you have any questions, please contact me 
at Kris.Neuhauser@ks.gov or our main line at 785-564-6640.

Sincerely,

Kris Neuhauser
Environmental Scientist
Water Appropriation Program

enclosure



From:                                 McColloch, Austin [KDA]
Sent:                                  Mon 7/20/2020 8:23 AM
To:                                      Neuhauser, Kris [KDA]
Subject:                             FW: Message from P-ELD346
Attachments:                   SP-ELD34620072007241.pdf

I think this is for you.
 
 
 
 
Austin McColloch
Ph: (620) 276-2901
 

From: Springer, Jarrod <Jarrod.Springer@HollyFrontier.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 20, 2020 7:27 AM
To: McColloch, Austin [KDA] <Austin.McColloch@ks.gov>; 'martyternes@yahoo.com' <martyternes@yahoo.com>
Subject: FW: Message from P-ELD346
 

EXTERNAL: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click any links or open any 
attachments unless you trust the sender and know the content is safe. 

Austin,
 
Attached is the map and well logs for File number 50398 for Marty Ternes. Let me know if you need anything else.
 
Thanks Jarrod 
 
From: P-ELD346@hollyfrontier.com <P-ELD346@hollyfrontier.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 20, 2020 7:25 AM
To: Springer, Jarrod <Jarrod.Springer@HollyFrontier.com>
Subject: Message from P-ELD346
 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:  This e-mail, and any attachments, may contain information that is privileged and 
confidential.If you received this message in error, please advise the sender immediately by reply e-mail and do not 
retain any paper or electronic copies of this message or any attachments.Unless expressly stated, nothing contained 
in this message should be construed as a digital or electronic signature or a commitment to a binding agreement. 
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From:                                 McColloch, Austin [KDA]
Sent:                                  Mon 7/27/2020 3:59 PM
To:                                      Neuhauser, Kris [KDA]
Subject:                             FW: Marty Ternes Well Logs
Attachments:                   Marty Ternes 4-2019 logs.pdf

This is for you again I believe. Do you want to take over his other files too in Sumner Co. as well? I feel I am not doing 
a very good job at working these app outside GCFO with all the workload I got going on here. 
 
 
 
 
Austin McColloch
Ph: (620) 276-2901
 

From: Springer, Jarrod <Jarrod.Springer@HollyFrontier.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 27, 2020 3:40 PM
To: McColloch, Austin [KDA] <Austin.McColloch@ks.gov>
Cc: 'martyternes@yahoo.com' <martyternes@yahoo.com>
Subject: Marty Ternes Well Logs
 

EXTERNAL: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click any links or open any attachments 
unless you trust the sender and know the content is safe. 

Austin,
 
Attached are the proper well logs to Section 34 that I sent you last Monday or Tuesday.
 
Let me know if you need anything else to keep these moving.
 
Thanks 
Jarrod 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:  This e-mail, and any attachments, may contain information that is privileged and 
confidential.If you received this message in error, please advise the sender immediately by reply e-mail and do not 
retain any paper or electronic copies of this message or any attachments.Unless expressly stated, nothing contained 
in this message should be construed as a digital or electronic signature or a commitment to a binding agreement. 
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